
 

Voice. Treaty. Truth.  
Film screening and panel 
discussion

In the spirit of this year’s 
NAIDOC theme Voice. Treaty. 
Truth., Knox City Council and 
the Local Aboriginal Network 
are proud to present a screening 
of The Warrigal Creek Massacre 
documentary.  
This documentary tells the story 
of the Warrigal Creek massacre  
of 1843 in Gippsland, Victoria, 
where as many as 150 Gunai 
Kurnai children, women and 
men were killed by a group of 
European colonisers.

The Warrigal Creek Massacre 
event will include:
•	Smoking Ceremony and 	 	
	 Welcome to Country
•	Refreshments
•	Film screening
•	Panel-led discussion
Date: Thursday 11 July 2019
Time: 6.30pm – 9.30pm
Location: Knox Community Arts 
Centre, Cnr Mountain Highway 
and Scoresby Road, Bayswater
Bookings: Limited tickets available 
at stickytickets.com.au/88395
For more information on   
NAIDOC Week in Knox, visit  
knox.vic.gov.au/naidoc
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